




Guru Tegh Bahadur 3rd

Centenary Public School

BRAIN GYM WORKSHOP

'Young Crusaders' Interact Club of Guru
Tegh Bahadur 3rd Centenary Public School,
under the aegis of Rotary Club of Delhi,
Safdarjung, organized ‘Brain Gym
Workshop’ in the school on 16th May, 2023.

Rtn. Teena Kapoor, mindfulness based
counsellor, conducted the session and
addressed 100 plus students and teachers.
She demonstrated various techniques to
wipe away stress, anxiety and depression
and restore inner peace and calm.



She urged the students to try novel things
apart from the streamlined activities and use
their senses to observe something new.

It was followed by the whole group practising
Bhramari Pranayama, Colour quiz, Eye
Exercises and Anulom Vilom. Spending a few
moments in doing these exercises, relieves
negativity, anger and frustration. It also
improves self confidence and boosts immunity.

The charismatic lady convener, Rtn. Teena
Kapoor successfully motivated the students to
practise Meditation and Pranayam daily and
optimise their brain power.

It was a highly enriching and exciting session
which ended with lot of relaxation, joy and
happiness.

Mrs. Madhu Varma
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